
AIDS Budget and Appropriations Coalition 
 

The AIDS Budget and 
Appropriations Coalition (ABAC) 
is a working group of the Federal 
AIDS Policy Partnership, a 
coalition of over two hundred 
national and community-based 
HIV/AIDS and public health 
organizations that represent 
people living with HIV/AIDS, HIV 
medical providers and 
researchers, and advocates, as 
well as community organizations 
that provide critical HIV-related 
health care and support services.  
ABAC advocates for adequate 
resources for domestic HIV/AIDS 
programs across the federal 
government.   
 
For more information, please 
contact the ABAC co-chairs:  
Carl Schmid, The AIDS Institute, 
cschmid@theaidsinstitute.org; 
Ronald Johnson, AIDS United, 
rjohnson@aidsunited.org; or  
Emily McCloskey, National 
Alliance of State and Territorial 
AIDS Directors, 
emccloskey@nastad.org.   
 
 
 

 

Key Documents: 

 List of ABAC Member Organizations 

 FY 2016 Appropriations Chart of Federal 

HIV/AIDS Programs  

 HIV Community Sign-on Letter to Congress 

on the need to fund Domestic HIV/AIDS 

Programs  

 HIV/AIDS  Statistics in the US 

 Ryan White HIV/AIDS Program 

 HIV Prevention in the United States  

 HIV/AIDS Research at the NIH 

 Structural Interventions for PLWHA 

Additional Electronic Documents: 

 Kaiser Family Foundation HIV/AIDS Policy 

Fact Sheet 

 National HIV/AIDS Strategy Fact Sheet 

 Support Comprehensive Sex Education & 

Adolescent Sexual Health Promotion  

 Support STD Prevention Funding 

 Viral Hepatitis Funding Recommendations  

 Ryan White Program Part C: Providing Health 

Care to People with HIV/AIDS in 

Underserved Communities 

 Ryan White Program Part D: Women, 

Children & Youth 

 Minority AIDS Initiative 

 

[Additional Documents in Development]  

 

All documents can be accessed electronically at: 
http://federalaidspolicy.org/category/abac/ 

http://federalaidspolicy.org/category/abac/
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2020 Leading Women’s Society/SisterLove 

30 for 30 Campaign  

ADAP Educational Initiative 

Advocates For Youth 

African American Health Alliance 

AIDS Action Coalition 

AIDS Alabama 

AIDS Alliance for Women, Infants, Children, Youth & Families 

AIDS Coalition for Education 

AIDS Foundation of Chicago 

The AIDS Institute 

AIDS Project Los Angeles  

AIDS Project New Haven 

AIDS Research Consortium of Atlanta 

AIDS Resource Center of Wisconsin 

AIDS Taskforce of Greater Cleveland (ATFGC) 

AIDS United 

APLA Health & Wellness  

AVAC: Global Advocacy for HIV Prevention 

American Academy of HIV Medicine 

American Psychological Association 

amfAR, The Foundation for AIDS Research 

The Association of Maternal & Child    

     Health Programs (AMCHP) 

Brooklyn AIDS Task Force 

Cascade AIDS Project 

Communities Advocating Emergency AIDS  

     Relief (CAEAR) Coalition 

Community Access National Network  

Community Education Group 

Elizabeth Glaser Pediatric AIDS Foundation 

Empower U, Inc.  

Family Centers, Inc. 

Fenway Health 

Gay Men's Health Crisis (GMHC) 

Georgia AIDS Coalition 

The Global Justice Institute  

God’s Love We Deliver 

Harlem United 

Harm Reduction Coalition 

Health GAP (Global Access Project) 

HealthHIV 

Healthy Teen Network 

Hennepin County, Minnesota Human  

     Services and Public Health Department 

The HIV Dental Alliance  

HIV Medicine Association 

HIVRN Associates 

Housing Works 

Human Rights Campaign  

Hyacinth AIDS Foundation 

The Infectious Diseases Society of America 

The Latino Commission on AIDS 

Los Angeles County Department of Public Health, Division of 

HIV and STD Programs 

Los Angeles LGBT Center 

Metropolitan Community Churches  

Metropolitan Latino AIDS Coalition (MLAC) 

Minnesota AIDS Project 

Nashville CARES 

National AIDS Housing Coalition (NAHC) 

National Alliance for HIV Education and 

     Workforce Development (NAHEWD) 

National Alliance of State and  

     Territorial AIDS Directors (NASTAD) 

The National Black Leadership  

     Commission on AIDS (NBLCA) 

National Coalition for LGBT Health 

National Coalition of STD Directors (NCSD) 

National Women and AIDS Collective (NWAC) 

National Minority AIDS Council (NMAC) 

New York City AIDS Housing Network (NYCAHN) 

New York City Department of Health & Mental Hygiene 

New York City Human Resources Administration Department 

of Social Services 

Northern Nevada HOPES 

Ohio AIDS Coalition 

Positive Women’s Network - USA 

Prevention Point Pittsburgh 

Project Inform 

Racial & Ethnic Health Disparities Coalition 

Ribbon Consulting Group 

Ruth M. Rothstein CORE Center  

Ryan White Medical Providers Coalition 

The San Francisco AIDS Foundation (SFAF) 

Saint Louis Effort for AIDS 

Sexuality Information and Education  

     Council of the United States (SIECUS) 

Southern HIV/AIDS Strategy Initiative 

START at Westminster  

Tennessee Association of People With AIDS 

Treatment Access Expansion Project (TAEP) 

Treatment Action Group (TAG) 

The Urban Coalition for HIV/AIDS  

     Prevention Services (UCHAPS)  

Village Care 

Women at Work International 

Women Organized to Respond to Life  

     Threatening Disease (WORLD) 

Women With a Vision, Inc. 

 

 


